

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025166V34765

Voucher: 34765

Status: 06/23/2020 Paid

Case ID: 6686

Docket: JV16-314

Client: Asencio, Haiden

Business Unit: 6230

Object Code: 64125

Time

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	12/20/2018	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Review; Order Continuing Temporary Legal Custody with the Nebraska Depart
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	12/21/2018	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail fril E. Strickland (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	01/08/2019	0.80	\$65.00	\$52.00
				<i>Note:</i> Review PDI and Treatment Update; E-mail to parties (1), M. Carraher (1); Receive and review e-mail from M
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	01/09/2019	0.15	\$65.00	\$9.75
				<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing (JV18-63)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/10/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from E. Strickland (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	01/11/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Continuing Juvenile on Probation; Order Setting Review Hearing (JV18-63)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/11/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1); E-mail to K. Morrow (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meetii	01/15/2019	0.55	\$65.00	\$35.75
				<i>Note:</i> Attend treatment team meeting (by phone)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/15/2019	0.40	\$65.00	\$26.00
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from E. Strickland (2), M. Martin (1), A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (2); E-mail to E. Strick
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/16/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1); E-mail to K. Morrow (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/17/2019	0.20	\$65.00	\$13.00
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/18/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	02/08/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	02/11/2019	0.45	\$65.00	\$29.25
				<i>Note:</i> E-mail to A. Feit (2); Receive and review e-mail from M. Molina (3), A. Feit (3), K. Morrow (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	02/12/2019	0.55	\$65.00	\$35.75
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (4), M. Kirk (2), M. Molina (2), K. Morrow (2); E-mail to A. Feit (2)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meetii	02/12/2019	0.35	\$65.00	\$22.75
				<i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting (by phone)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	02/13/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from E. Strickland (1)

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025166V34765			
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/14/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Motion to Revoke Probation (JV18-63)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/15/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Appointing Guardian ad Litem (JV18-63)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/15/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Appointing Counsel for MTRP (JV18-63)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/15/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order for Immediate Custody (JV18-63)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/18/2019	0.15	\$65.00	\$9.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from E. Strickland (2); E-mail to E. Strickland (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/18/2019	0.25	\$65.00	\$16.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Review file				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/19/2019	0.60	\$65.00	\$39.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeti	<i>Note:</i> Attend treatment team meeting				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/19/2019	0.75	\$65.00	\$48.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Molina (2), A. Feit (4), E. Strickland (3), M. Kirk (3); E-mail to A. Feit (3)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/20/2019	0.20	\$65.00	\$13.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Motion to Withdraw and e-mail from M. Carraher (1); Receive and review e-mail from La				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/20/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order for Transport (JV18-63)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/20/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Allowing Public Defender to Withdraw and Appointing Counsel (JV18-63)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/20/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from J. Rockhill (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/21/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from E. Strickland (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/21/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Review discharge summary				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/22/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Molina (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/26/2019	0.25	\$65.00	\$16.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), M. Molina (1), A. Feit (2), M. Kirk (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/27/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Review PDI				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/27/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Motion for Emergency Placement Change				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/27/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	<i>Note:</i> Attend Hearing				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/27/2019	0.20	\$65.00	\$13.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1), M. Kirk (1), A. Feit (1)				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference #	LACS0623201025166V34765		
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/01/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Regarding Detention Hearing (JV18-63)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/01/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Denial; Order Setting Motion to Revoke Probation for Formal Hearing (JV18-63)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/01/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Canceling Immediate Custody (JV18-63)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/04/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Turner (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/04/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Aproving Emergency Placement Change</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/05/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Review file; e-mail to A. Osborn (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Osborn (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/08/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Noticing Placement at YRTC</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/08/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Motion to Commit to YRTC (JV18-63)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/08/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order of Adjudication of Violation of Probation (JV18-63)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/08/2019	0.65	\$65.00	\$42.25	
<i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	<i>Note: Attend hearing; client meeting</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/08/2019	0.55	\$65.00	\$35.75	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Review PDI; E-mail to M. Molina (2), A. Osborn (1); Receive and reievew e-mail from A. Osborn (2), C. Turne</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/08/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Continuing Review and Permanency Hearing</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/18/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1) with attachment (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/25/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/26/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/27/2019	0.25	\$65.00	\$16.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Santiago (2), A. Feit (2); E-mail to A. Feit (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/02/2019	0.15	\$65.00	\$9.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Osborn (1), S. Slater (1); E-mail to S. Slater (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/10/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail with attachment from A. Feit (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/11/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/17/2019	0.60	\$65.00	\$39.00	
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meetii</i>	<i>Note: Attend team meeting</i>				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025166V34765			
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/30/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/01/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), A. Feit (1), J. Ward (1), K. Morrow (1),				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/02/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), M. Kirk (1); E-mail to T. Menard (1); R				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/02/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Continuing Review and Permanency Hearing				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/09/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/13/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	<i>Note:</i> Call to S. Slater (PO)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/14/2019	0.20	\$65.00	\$13.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (1), K. Morrow (1), A. Feit (2)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/15/2019	0.80	\$65.00	\$52.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeti	<i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/27/2019	0.20	\$65.00	\$13.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Review FCRO Report				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/06/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/07/2019	1.15	\$65.00	\$74.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Review CRCP, CASA Report, and FCRO report; Prepare, file, and serve GAL report				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/10/2019	0.75	\$65.00	\$48.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing; conference with Parties				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/10/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (2)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/11/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/12/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/19/2019	0.60	\$65.00	\$39.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeti	<i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/24/2019	0.25	\$65.00	\$16.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (2), S. Johnson (1), A. Feit (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/24/2019	0.40	\$65.00	\$26.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeti	<i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting (by phone)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/28/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), M. Carr (2); E-mail to M. Carr (2)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	07/01/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Carr (2); E-mail to M. Carr (1)				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025166V34765
Attorney Time - \$75.00	07/03/2019	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Case Plan (YRTC)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	07/15/2019	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to A. Feit (2); Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), M. Kirk (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	07/15/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	<i>Note: Attend PO team meeting (by phone)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	07/16/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	07/18/2019	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	<i>Note: Attend PO team meeting</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	07/24/2019	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (4), K. Morrow (1), M. Kirk (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	07/25/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review email from A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	07/31/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	08/01/2019	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1), A. Feit (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	08/13/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail with attachment from A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	08/21/2019	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (2), M. Kirk (1), A. Osborn (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	08/22/2019	0.45 \$75.00 \$33.75
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	<i>Note: Attend PO team meeting (by phone)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	08/22/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to A. Osborn (2)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	08/23/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/11/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (1), A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/11/2019	0.40 \$75.00 \$30.00
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	<i>Note: Attend team meeting (by phone)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/24/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/27/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/30/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/01/2019	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from M. Asencio (1), K. Morrow (1), A. Feit (1)</i>	

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025166V34765			
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/07/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/09/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/10/2019	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (2), M. Kirk (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/23/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Osborn (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/25/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/28/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1), S. Slater (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/29/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and Review email from S. Asencio</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/30/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and Review email from A. Feit (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/05/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to A. Feit (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/06/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/13/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/20/2019	0.70	\$75.00	\$52.50	
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meetii</i>	<i>Note: Attend team meeting</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/21/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/22/2019	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (1), J. Ward (1), C. Turner (1); E-mail to M. Kirk (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/26/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call to M. Kirk</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/26/2019	0.40	\$75.00	\$30.00	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to M. Kirk (1); Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (3), A. Osborn (1), A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1), C</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/02/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Motion to Continue</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/02/2019	0.25	\$75.00	\$18.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (1), K. Morrow (1), A. Feit (1) Lancaster county District Court (1); E-i</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/03/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/04/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order to Continue</i>				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025166V34765
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/05/2019	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (2), K. Morrow (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/10/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to A. Feit (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/16/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (1); E-mail to J. Ward (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/16/2019	0.85 \$75.00 \$63.75
<i>Activity:</i> Draft/Document Prepa	<i>Note:</i> Review CRCP; Prepare, file, and serve GAL report	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/17/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/17/2019	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25
<i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/19/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Review	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/19/2019	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeti	<i>Note:</i> Attend PO Team Meeting (by phone)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/30/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/02/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to A. Feit (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/03/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1), M. Asencio (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/06/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), M. Kirk (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/10/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/14/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/14/2020	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25
<i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeti	<i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/17/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/24/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/28/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1)	
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	01/30/2020	0.30 \$25.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeti	<i>Note:</i> Team Meeting (by phone) (AB for CW)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/13/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Directing Release for Review to the FCRO	

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025166V34765
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/26/2020	0.85 \$75.00 \$63.75
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeting</i>	<i>Note: Attend team meeting</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/26/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (1), A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/27/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1); Review file</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/27/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeting</i>	<i>Note: Attend team meeting (by phone)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/16/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (2), M. Kirk (1), K. Morrow (1); E-mail to A. Feit (2)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/23/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), M. Kirk (1), K. Morrow (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/25/2020	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (2), J. Ward (1), K. Morrow (1), A. Feit (1), A. Osborn (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/25/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Motion to Continue</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/26/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Motion to Continue</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/26/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review from M. Kirk (3), J. Ward (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); E-mail to M. Kirk (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/27/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from K. Morrow (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/27/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Motion to Continue</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/30/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (2), K. Morrow (1), M. Kirk (2); E-mail to A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/31/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Feit (1), K. Morrow (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/09/2020	0.40 \$75.00 \$30.00
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeting</i>	<i>Note: Attend team meeting (via Zoom)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/09/2020	0.45 \$75.00 \$33.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (3), A. Feit (4), K. Morrow (1); E-mail to A. Feit (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/14/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Setting Reentry Hearing</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/20/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeting</i>	<i>Note: Attend PO Treatment Team Meeting (by phone)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/20/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to M. Carr (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/06/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Motion for Expedited Reentry Hearing</i>	

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025166V34765			
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/07/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to A. Feit (1); Receive and review e-mail from M. Kirk (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/11/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Overruling Expedited Re-Entry Hearing</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/03/2020	0.25	\$75.00	\$18.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), J. Judds (1), A. Osborn (1); E-mail to L</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/03/2020	1.90	\$75.00	\$142.50	
<i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	<i>Note: Review CRCP, CASA Report, Reentry Plan; Prepare GAL Report; Call with M. Kirk</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/04/2020	0.70	\$75.00	\$52.50	
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	<i>Note: Attend hearing (By Zoom)</i>				
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	06/04/2020	0.10	\$25.00	\$2.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: 1 email sent/reviewed regarding Haiden Asencio - JV18-63</i>				
			Total Paid:	2414.50	

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025167V34803

Voucher: 34803

Status: 06/23/2020 Paid

Case ID: 11011

Docket: JV17-623

Client: Rodriguez, Eric

Business Unit: 6230

Object Code: 64125

Time

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/10/2018	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
<i>Note:</i> E-mail to T. Vacek (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/15/2018	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/16/2018	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), J. McNeil (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	10/22/2018	1.10	\$65.00	\$71.50
<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing ; conference with parties				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	10/22/2018	0.20	\$65.00	\$13.00
<i>Note:</i> Review CRCP and GAL report				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	10/24/2018	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Review; Order Setting Further Review Hearing; Interim Orders				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com	10/25/2018	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50
<i>Note:</i> Letter to client				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/05/2018	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/15/2018	0.15	\$65.00	\$9.75
<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County District Court (2). T. Vacek (1); E-mail to Lancaster Count				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	11/15/2018	0.95	\$65.00	\$61.75
<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/16/2018	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Court (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/21/2018	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/26/2018	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Review; Order Committing Temporary Legal Custody with the Nebraska Depar.				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com	11/26/2018	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50
<i>Note:</i> Letter to client				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	02/04/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50
<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), M. Norrie (1), J. McNeil (1), T. Vacek (
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	02/05/2019	0.40	\$65.00	\$26.00
<i>Note:</i> E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), T. Vacek (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster Cou				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	02/06/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1)				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025167V34803
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/11/2019	0.60 \$65.00 \$39.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), M. Norrie (1), Clinic (3), J. McNeil (1),</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/12/2019	0.95 \$65.00 \$61.75 <i>Note: E-mail to T. Vacek (5), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (7), J.</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/13/2019	0.40 \$65.00 \$26.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), J. McNeil (2), T. Vacek (2), M. Norrie (</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/14/2019	0.30 \$65.00 \$19.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), M. Norrie (1), T. Vacek (1), J. McNeil (</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	02/15/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Court Order granting continuance</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	02/19/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Call with client</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	02/19/2019	1.00 \$65.00 \$65.00 <i>Note: Attend team meeting</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	04/03/2019	1.15 \$65.00 \$74.75 <i>Note: Attend hearing; Conference with client and Parties</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	04/03/2019	1.10 \$65.00 \$71.50 <i>Note: Review CRCP and GAL report; E-mail to GAL</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	04/05/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order of Review; Order Committing Temporary Legal Custody with NDHHS with in-hom</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i>	04/11/2019	0.30 \$65.00 \$19.50 <i>Note: Letter to client</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/17/2019	0.20 \$65.00 \$13.00 <i>Note: Review update from LFS; E-mail to T. Vacek (2); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/08/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review therapist update; E-mail to T. Vacek (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/14/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), R. Kunz (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/15/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: E-mail to T. Vacek (1); Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/16/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), J. McNeil (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/27/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: E-mail to T. Vacek (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Meeting with</i>	06/27/2019	0.15 \$65.00 \$9.75 <i>Note: Conference with client</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/28/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: E-mail to T. Vacek (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	06/28/2019	0.45 \$65.00 \$29.25 <i>Note: Call with client</i>

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025167V34803
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	08/28/2019	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (3), J. McNeil (2), M. Paxton (1); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeti	08/30/2019	0.60 \$75.00 \$45.00 <i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/02/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Helbusch (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/04/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from J. Houlden (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/06/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note:</i> E-mail to J. Houlden (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	10/01/2019	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note:</i> Review CRCP and GAL report
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	10/02/2019	0.95 \$75.00 \$71.25 <i>Note:</i> Attend hearing
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com	10/07/2019	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note:</i> Letter to client
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	10/07/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Review; Order Continuing Legal Custody with the Nebraska Department of Hei
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com	10/08/2019	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note:</i> Letter to client
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/22/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note:</i> E-mail to T. Vacek (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/23/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note:</i> E-mail to T. Vacek (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/26/2019	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mails from Client (3)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/29/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note:</i> E-mail to Client (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/04/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from client (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/13/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from client (2)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/13/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note:</i> E-mail to client
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/20/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note:</i> E-mail to T. Vacek (1), Client (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/21/2019	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (3), Client (1); E-mail to client (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/23/2019	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from client (2) with attachments (1); T. Vacek (1)

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025167V34803
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	11/24/2019	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from client (2); E-mail to client (1),</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	11/25/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1); E-mail to client (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	11/26/2019	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (2), S. Sabata (1), J. McNeil (2); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	11/26/2019	1.60 \$75.00 \$120.00 <i>Note: Attend team meeting; Conference with client</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	11/27/2019	0.40 \$75.00 \$30.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from D. Kerr (1), J. McNeil (1), T. Vacek (1), S. Sabata (3), A. Hellbusch (1); E-m</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	11/27/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Motion for placement change</i>
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	12/02/2019	0.05 \$25.00 \$1.25 <i>Note: Phone call to PO K. Baber</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	12/03/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Motion to Withdraw Motion for Placement Change</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	12/03/2019	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), D. Kerr (1), A. Hellbusch (2)</i>
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	12/03/2019	0.05 \$25.00 \$1.25 <i>Note: Phone call with PO K. Baber</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	12/04/2019	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1), A. Hellbusch (1), T. Vacek (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Ju</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	12/04/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order Granting Motion to Withdraw Motion for Placement Change</i>
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	12/04/2019	0.30 \$25.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Phone call with PO K. Baber; Notes on updates</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	12/08/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	12/09/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (1), T. Vacek (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	12/09/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order to Continue Review Hearing</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	12/10/2019	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i>	12/10/2019	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note: Letter to client</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	12/11/2019	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), D. Kerr (1), A. Hellbusch (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	12/12/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Objection to Placement Change</i>

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025167V34803
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/12/2019	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
Activity: Review of:	Note: Receive and review Motion for Change of Placement and Affidavit	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/12/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Activity: Emailing	Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (2)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/13/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Activity: Review of:	Note: Receive and review Order Setting Hearing on the Motion for Placement Change	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/13/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Activity: Review of:	Note: Receive and review Motion to Withdraw Objection to Placement Change	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/16/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Activity: Emailing	Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (2)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/17/2019	0.85 \$75.00 \$63.75
Activity: Hearing:	Note: Attend Hearing on Motion for Placement Change	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/23/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Activity: Review of:	Note: Receive and review Order; Notice of Review Hearing	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/06/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Activity: Emailing	Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbush	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/07/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Activity: Emailing	Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbush	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/16/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
Activity: Emailing	Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek with attachment (2)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/21/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50
Activity: Review of:	Note: Review CRCP and GAL report	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/22/2020	1.00 \$75.00 \$75.00
Activity: Hearing:	Note: Attend hearing; Conference with client	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/22/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50
Activity: Review of:	Note: Review CRCP and GAL report	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/24/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
Activity: Emailing	Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/28/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
Activity: Correspondence/Com	Note: Letter to client	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/28/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
Activity: Emailing	Note: E-mail to D. Kerr (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), D. Kerr (2)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/28/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Activity: Review of:	Note: Receive and review Order of Review	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/03/2020	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75
Activity: Emailing	Note: Receive and review e-mail from D. Kerr (2), A. Marx (1), E. Synowicki (1); E-mail to D. Kerr (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/05/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
Activity: Emailing	Note: Receive and review e-mail from client (2); E-mail to client (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/06/2020	0.55 \$75.00 \$41.25
Activity: Emailing	Note: Receive and review e-mail from client (5), E. Synowicki (1); E-mail to client (4), E. Synowicki (1)	

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025167V34803
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/18/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Volmer (1), J. McNeil (1), T. Vacek (1); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/25/2020	1.00 \$75.00 \$75.00
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeting</i>	<i>Note: Attend team meeting</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/26/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Correspondence/Conference</i>	<i>Note: Conference with J. McNeil and T. Vacek</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/27/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from client (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/02/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/09/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (2), T. Vacek (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/12/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/13/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to A. Hellbusch (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (1), T. Vacek (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/14/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (2), D. Kerr (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/15/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from D. Kerr (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/16/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Motion to Continue</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/16/2020	0.80 \$75.00 \$60.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to D. Kerr (1), Client (1), A. Hellbusch (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (3), Lancaster (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/17/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Granting Motion to Continue</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/19/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity: Correspondence/Conference</i>	<i>Note: Letter to client</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/10/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (1), T. Vacek (1), Client (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to client (1), J. McNeil (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/13/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to client (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/15/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to A. Hellbusch (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (2)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/16/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to A. Hellbusch (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (1), T. Vacek (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/17/2020	0.90 \$75.00 \$67.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Hellbusch (6), J. McNeil (5), T. Vacek (7); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/18/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1)</i>	

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025167V34803			
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/20/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/21/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), M. Paxton (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/23/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive Draft PPA and Child Support Statement from Mediation Center</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/23/2020	0.80	\$75.00	\$60.00	
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	<i>Note: Attend team meeting (By Zoom)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/23/2020	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Review file</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/29/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and Review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/06/2020	0.25	\$75.00	\$18.75	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Review CRCP and GAL Report</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/06/2020	0.35	\$75.00	\$26.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from D. Kerr (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), J. McNeil (1), T. Vacek (2)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/07/2020	0.45	\$75.00	\$33.75	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Review CRCP and GAL Report</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/07/2020	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1), D. Kerr (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/07/2020	0.75	\$75.00	\$56.25	
<i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	<i>Note: Attend hearing (via Zoom)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/08/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/14/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order of Review</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/14/2020	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i>	<i>Note: Letter 05-14-20</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/27/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to T. Vacek (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/27/2020	0.70	\$75.00	\$52.50	
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	<i>Note: Attend team meeting (By Zoom)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/09/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and Review e-mail from client (1)</i>				

Expenses

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	10/25/2018	3.00	\$0.05	\$0.15
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies (3) 10-25-18</i>			
Postage	10/25/2018	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>			

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025167V34803			
Postage	11/26/2018	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>				
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	11/26/2018	7.00	\$0.05	\$0.35	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies (7) 11-26-18</i>				
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	04/11/2019	7.00	\$0.05	\$0.35	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies (7) 04-11-19</i>				
Postage	04/11/2019	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>				
Postage	10/08/2019	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>				
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	10/08/2019	7.00	\$0.05	\$0.35	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies (7) 10-7-19</i>				
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	12/10/2019	1.00	\$0.05	\$0.05	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies (1) 12-10-19</i>				
Postage	12/10/2019	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>				
Postage	01/28/2020	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>				
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	01/28/2020	7.00	\$0.05	\$0.35	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies (7) 01-28-20</i>				
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	03/19/2020	1.00	\$0.05	\$0.05	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies (1) 03-19-20</i>				
Postage	03/20/2020	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>				
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	05/14/2020	8.00	\$0.05	\$0.40	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies for 05-14-20 (8)</i>				
Postage	05/14/2020	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>				
			Total Paid:	2531.80	

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025168V34834

Voucher: 34834

Status: 06/23/2020 Paid

Case ID: 11692

Docket: JV18-60

Client: Burch, Trever

Business Unit: 6230

Object Code: 64125

Time

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	12/26/2018	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Douglass (1), J. McNeil (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	01/08/2019	0.15	\$65.00	\$9.75
<i>Note: Call with client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/09/2019	0.85	\$65.00	\$55.25
<i>Note: E-mail to C. Turner (2), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (3), J. McNeil (1); Receive and reievew e-mail from (</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	01/10/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
<i>Note: Call with client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/10/2019	0.35	\$65.00	\$22.75
<i>Note: E-mail to C. Roberts (2), M. Douglass (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Roberts (1), M. Douglass (2)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	01/10/2019	0.35	\$65.00	\$22.75
<i>Note: Prepare, file and serve Motion to Continue</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/14/2019	0.20	\$65.00	\$13.00
<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (2), M. Douglass (2)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/15/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Douglass (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	01/18/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
<i>Note: Call with client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/18/2019	0.20	\$65.00	\$13.00
<i>Note: E-mail to M. Douglass (1); Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1), A. Brown (1), M. Douglass (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/21/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
<i>Note: E-mail to M. Douglass (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/22/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Douglass (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	01/31/2019	0.20	\$65.00	\$13.00
<i>Note: Call with client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/04/2019	0.35	\$65.00	\$22.75
<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Douglass (4), J. McNeil (1), A. Brown (1); E-mail to M. Douglass (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	02/07/2019	0.80	\$65.00	\$52.00
<i>Note: Attend team meeting</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/07/2019	0.20	\$65.00	\$13.00
<i>Note: E-mail to M. Douglass (2); Receive and review e-mail from M. Douglass (2)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i>	02/07/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50
<i>Note: Letter to client</i>				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference #	LACS0623201025168V34834		
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/11/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (1); E-mail to A. Brown (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/16/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/20/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Douglass (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/22/2019	0.25	\$65.00	\$16.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), M. Douglass (2), C. Roberts (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/25/2019	0.25	\$65.00	\$16.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), C. Turner (1), A. Brown (1), M. Douglass (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/26/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Roberts (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/27/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and Review Motion to Continue</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	02/27/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call with client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/04/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order to Continue</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/04/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Continuing Review Hearing</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/07/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from J. Clark (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/07/2019	0.40	\$65.00	\$26.00	
<i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	<i>Note: Prepare, file, and serve Motion for Visitation</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/11/2019	0.15	\$65.00	\$9.75	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call with client (2)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/12/2019	1.15	\$65.00	\$74.75	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Review CRCP and GAL report; E-mail to J. Clark (1); Receive and review e-mail from J. Clark (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/12/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Meeting with</i>	<i>Note: Conference with A. Brown</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/13/2019	0.50	\$65.00	\$32.50	
<i>Activity: Meeting with</i>	<i>Note: Conference with client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/13/2019	0.15	\$65.00	\$9.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to J. Clark with attachment (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/13/2019	1.65	\$65.00	\$107.25	
<i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	<i>Note: Attend hearing; client meeting</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/14/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to R. McClain (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/18/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order of Review; Notice of Review Hearing</i>				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference #	LACS0623201025168V34834		
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/18/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from J. Clark with attachment (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/01/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to J. Clark (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/01/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/02/2019	0.70	\$65.00	\$45.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (4), L. Jones (1); E-mail to B. Hunter (5); Review file</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/03/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/04/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1), B. Hunter (3), A. Brown (1), C. Turner (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/05/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/08/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to B. Hunter (1); Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/10/2019	0.15	\$65.00	\$9.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from S. Dunham (1), J. Rine (1), B. Hunter (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/11/2019	0.50	\$65.00	\$32.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (3), J. Rine (1), S. Dunham (2), J. Palacios (2), L. Jones (1); E-mail to B. Hunter (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/17/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/18/2019	0.55	\$65.00	\$35.75	
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeting</i>	<i>Note: Attend team meeting</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/30/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/01/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (3), J. Rine (1), J. McNeil (1), A. Brown (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/07/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/20/2019	0.15	\$65.00	\$9.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (2); E-mail to B. Hunter (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/21/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from L. Jones (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/23/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to L. Jones (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/30/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1), J. McNeil (1), O. Faubel (1), C. Turner (1), A. Brown (1); E-mail to B. Hunter (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/11/2019	0.15	\$65.00	\$9.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (2), J. McNeil (1)</i>				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025168V34834
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/12/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: E-mail to B. Hunter (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/13/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/17/2019	0.35 \$65.00 \$22.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (4), A. Brown (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to B. Hunter (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/18/2019	0.25 \$65.00 \$16.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (3), A. Brown (1), L. Jones (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/24/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1), J. McNeil (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	06/25/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: Call to PO, R. Baxter</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/25/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: E-mail to B. Hunter (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	06/26/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: Call to PO, R. Baxter and K. Woods</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	07/02/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Call to PO, Kristin Woods and PO, Rick Baxter</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	07/03/2019	0.45 \$75.00 \$33.75 <i>Note: E-mail to B. Hunter (2); Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (5), J. McNeil (1), A. Brown (1), T. Burch (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	07/03/2019	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Call with PO, Kristin Woods</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	07/09/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1), J. Palacios (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	07/10/2019	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (2), A. Brown (1), K. Wolff (1), M. Madison (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to B. Hunter (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	07/11/2019	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (1), K. Wolff (1), B. Hunter (1), J. McNeil (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	07/12/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: E-mail to B. Hunter (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Attending Team Meeting</i>	07/15/2019	1.10 \$75.00 \$82.50 <i>Note: Attend team meeting (in person and by phone)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	07/15/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Call to client (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	07/16/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: E-mail to A. Brown (1); Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	07/18/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (1), B. Hunter (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	08/07/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)</i>

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference #	LACS0623201025168V34834		
Attorney Time - \$65.00	08/09/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Meeting with</i>	<i>Note: Conference with C. Turner</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	08/16/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (2), H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	08/19/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to A. Brown (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	08/20/2019	0.40	\$75.00	\$30.00	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to B. Hunter (2), H. Valderstrasse (1); Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (3), H. Valderstrasse</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	08/26/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	08/27/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from B. Hunter (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/08/2019	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Review GAL Reprt</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/09/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call with K. Woods</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/09/2019	0.35	\$75.00	\$26.25	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Review CRCP</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/09/2019	1.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	
<i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	<i>Note: Attend hearing; conference with client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/10/2019	0.25	\$75.00	\$18.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to H. Vordstrasse (1); Receive and review e-mail from H. Vordstrasse (2), C. Turner (1); J. McNeil (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/12/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to H. Vordstrasse (1); Receive and review e-mail from H. Vordstrasse with attachment (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/17/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order of Review; Notice of Hearing</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/19/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity: Correspondence/Com:</i>	<i>Note: Letter to client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/03/2019	0.25	\$75.00	\$18.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2) with attachment (1), J. McNeil (1), A. Brown (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/17/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Meeting with</i>	<i>Note: Conference with J. McNeil</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/22/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1) with attachment (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/28/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1), H. Vorderstrasse (2)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/15/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call with client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/15/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025168V34834
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/18/2019	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (2); J. McNeil (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/22/2019	0.45 \$75.00 \$33.75
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeting</i>	<i>Note: Attend team meeting</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/22/2019	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (3), J. McNeil (4); E-mail to J. McNeil (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/23/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/26/2019	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (3), J. McNeil (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/02/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/13/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/18/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/26/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Turner (1), Client (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/26/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/30/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/06/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (4), Client (4), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/29/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown with attachment (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/02/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Turner (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/03/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/04/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail with attachment from H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/07/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/10/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (3)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/18/2020	0.40 \$75.00 \$30.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Call with client</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/20/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to C. Turner (1); Receive and review e-mail from C. Turner (1), J. McNeil (1)</i>	

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025168V34834
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/21/2020	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (3), Client (1); E-mail to client (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/24/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from H. Vo</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/25/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/26/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	02/26/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Call with client</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	02/26/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Review visitation notes</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	02/27/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note: Review CRCP; Review visitation notes</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/27/2020	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (3), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	02/27/2020	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25 <i>Note: Call with client</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/28/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from J. Miller with attachments (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	02/28/2020	1.00 \$75.00 \$75.00 <i>Note: Review CRCP</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	03/01/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note: Review GAL Report</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	03/02/2020	1.25 \$75.00 \$93.75 <i>Note: Attend hearing (AM for CCW)</i>
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	03/02/2020	1.00 \$25.00 \$25.00 <i>Note: Review visitation notes; Notes to file</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	03/02/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Review file</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/04/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Meeting with</i>	03/05/2020	0.45 \$75.00 \$33.75 <i>Note: Conference with H. Vorderstrasse</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/09/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	03/09/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Call with client</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	03/17/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order of Review</i>

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025168V34834
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/19/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i> <i>Note: Letter to client</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/25/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i> <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1), Client (1)</i>		
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	03/26/2020	0.60 \$25.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Review of:</i> <i>Note: Review visitation notes; Notes to file</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/30/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i> <i>Note: Call to client</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/30/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i> <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/31/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i> <i>Note: Receive and review H. Vorderstrasse (2), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/02/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i> <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/03/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i> <i>Note: Call with H. Vorderstrasse</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/06/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i> <i>Note: E-mail to Client (1), H. Vorderstrasse (2); Receive and review e-mail from Client (1), H. Vrderstrasse (2)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/07/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i> <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from J. Miller with attachment (1), H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/10/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i> <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/21/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i> <i>Note: E-mail to C. Turner (2), Client (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Turner (2), A. Brown (1), H. Vorderstra:</i>		
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	04/21/2020	0.10 \$25.00 \$2.50
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i> <i>Note: Call to client</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/21/2020	1.05 \$75.00 \$78.75
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meetii</i> <i>Note: Attend team meeting (By Zoom)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/30/2020	0.40 \$75.00 \$30.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i> <i>Note: 0 Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (4) with attachment (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to H. Vorde</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/04/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i> <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2), J. McNeil (1), Client (1); E-mail to Client (2)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/07/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity: Emailing</i> <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/11/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity: Emailing</i> <i>Note: E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1); Review file</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/11/2020	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i> <i>Note: Call with client</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/12/2020	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i> <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (4), Client (1)</i>		

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025168V34834
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	05/12/2020 <i>Note:</i> Call with client	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	05/12/2020 <i>Note:</i> Call with H. Vorderstrasse	0.60 \$75.00 \$45.00
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	05/19/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Brown (4), J. McNeil (5), C. Turner (2), K. Lauenroth (3); E-mail to A. Bro	0.75 \$75.00 \$56.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	05/21/2020 <i>Note:</i> E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1), K. Lauenroth (1); Review file	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	05/21/2020 <i>Note:</i> Call with client	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	05/22/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from K. Lauenroth (8), J. McNeil (6), A. Brown (3), C. Turner (2); E-mail to K. Lau	0.95 \$75.00 \$71.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	05/26/2020 <i>Note:</i> E-mail to S. Thompson (1), K. Lauenroth (1); Receive and review e-mail from S. Thompson (1)	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	05/26/2020 <i>Note:</i> Call with client	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meetii	05/26/2020 <i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting; E-mail to K. Lauenroth (1)	1.10 \$75.00 \$82.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	05/27/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from J. McNeil (1), K. Lauenroth (1)	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meetii	05/27/2020 <i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting (By Zoom)	0.70 \$75.00 \$52.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	05/29/2020 <i>Note:</i> Review CRCP	0.75 \$75.00 \$56.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	05/29/2020 <i>Note:</i> E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), K. Boko (1); Receive and review e-mail from K. Boko (1)	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com	06/01/2020 <i>Note:</i> Letter 06-01-20	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	06/01/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (3), C. Turner (2), A. Brown (2), C. Roberts	0.75 \$75.00 \$56.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	06/01/2020 <i>Note:</i> Attend hearing (By Zoom)	0.65 \$75.00 \$48.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	06/05/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Transferring Case to Judge White	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	06/05/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Review	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	06/08/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), H. Vorderstrasse (1)	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	06/08/2020 <i>Note:</i> E-mail to K. Lauenroth (1)	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025168V34834

Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/09/2020	0.40	\$75.00	\$30.00
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from K. Lauenroth (1), H. Vorderstrasse (2), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2).			
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/10/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)			

Expenses

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Postage	02/07/2019	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	03/19/2019	6.00	\$0.05	\$0.30
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Photo Copies for 03-18-19 (6)			
Postage	03/19/2019	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	09/19/2019	5.00	\$0.05	\$0.25
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Photo Copies for 09-19-19 (5)			
Postage	09/19/2019	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			
Postage	03/19/2020	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	03/19/2020	7.00	\$0.05	\$0.35
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Photo Copies for 03-19-20 (7)			
Postage	06/01/2020	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			

Total Paid: 3129.60

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025169V34846

Voucher: 34846

Status: 06/23/2020 Paid

Case ID: 12836

Docket: JV17-599

Client: Allbright/Erpelding Children

Business Unit: 6230

Object Code: 64125

Time

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	09/26/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Little (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	09/30/2019	0.75	\$75.00	\$56.25
	<i>Note: Attend hearing; Conference with Parties</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	09/30/2019	0.75	\$75.00	\$56.25
	<i>Note: Review CRCP; Draft GAL report</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	10/03/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note: Receive and review Order of Review; Notice of Review Hearing</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	11/19/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1), M. Little (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	12/05/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25
	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from V. Gorden (1), M. Little (1), A. Coleman</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	12/05/2019	0.90	\$75.00	\$67.50
	<i>Note: Review CRCP; Draft GAL report; E-mail to R. Townsend (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	12/06/2019	0.60	\$75.00	\$45.00
	<i>Note: Finalize and serve GAL report</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	12/06/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note: Receive and review Journal Entry and Order</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	12/06/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note: E-mail to R. Townsend (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	12/06/2019	0.50	\$75.00	\$37.50
	<i>Note: Attend Hearing</i>			

Total Paid: 303.75

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025170V34870

Voucher: 34870

Status: 06/23/2020 Paid

Case ID: 17195

Docket: JV19-431

Client: Pilcher, Erica

Business Unit: 6230

Object Code: 64125

Time

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	08/07/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Appointing Counsel
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	08/07/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Sturgeon (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Other	08/07/2019	0.50	\$75.00	\$37.50
				<i>Note:</i> Open office file
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	08/12/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> E-mail to C. Sturgeon (1); Receive and review e-mail from C. Sturgeon (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	08/19/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
				<i>Note:</i> E-mail to C. Sturgeon (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	08/21/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Sturgeon (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com	08/22/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50
				<i>Note:</i> Letter to client
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	08/22/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (1); E-mail to J. Ward (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	08/22/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Journal Entry and Order
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	08/22/2019	0.75	\$75.00	\$56.25
				<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing; client meeting
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/09/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Meeting with	09/09/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25
				<i>Note:</i> Conference with C. Sturgeon
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/12/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/15/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and Review email from J. Ward (1); Email to J. Ward (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	09/16/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Setting Formal Hearing
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	09/16/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Journal Entry and Order
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	09/16/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25
				<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025170V34870			
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/18/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/19/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Draft/Document Prepa	<i>Note:</i> Prepare, file and serve Motion to Continue				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/20/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/23/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Granting Continuance				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/25/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	<i>Note:</i> Call to client				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	09/25/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Sturgeon (1), K. Walton (1); E-mail to C. Sturgeon (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/04/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/09/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/17/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Draft/Document Prepa	<i>Note:</i> Prepare, file, and serve Motion to Continue and Proposed Order				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/21/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Granting Continuance				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/22/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com	<i>Note:</i> Letter to client				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/24/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Sturgeon (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/28/2019	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from L. Johnson (1), K. Walton (1), M. Works (1), J. Ward (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/29/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Motion to Discharge				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/30/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Discharging Counsel				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/05/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/08/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/11/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to J. Ward (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/12/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/13/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Setting Hearing				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025170V34870
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/13/2019	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (2), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), K. Walton (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/15/2019	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i>	<i>Note: Letter to client</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/15/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Granting Continuance</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/15/2019	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	<i>Note: Prepare, file, and serve Motion to Continue</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/21/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/22/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from R. Remington (1); E-mail to R. Remington (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/09/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Trial list</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/12/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to J. Ward (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/12/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Setting Formal Hearing</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/13/2019	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2); E-mail to Lancaster Coun</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/16/2019	2.70 \$75.00 \$202.50
<i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	<i>Note: Attend formal hearing</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/20/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Review CRCP and GAL Report</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/21/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order of Disposition, etc.</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/21/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50
<i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	<i>Note: Attend hearing</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/22/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i>	<i>Note: Letter to client</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/29/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to R. Remington (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/31/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and Review Email from H. Bates (2)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/31/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call with Client</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/01/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Bates (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/02/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Bates (1)</i>	

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025170V34870
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	02/04/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from R. Remmington (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	02/05/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from R. Remmington (3), K. Walton (2); E-mail to R. Remmington (2)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	03/16/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review Letter F. Al-Haidari (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/24/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from R. Remington (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/27/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note:</i> E-mail to R. Remington (1); Receive and review e-mail from R. Remmington (1), F. Al-Haidari
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	04/08/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	04/09/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from F. Al-Haidari (1), K. Walton (1); E-mail to F. Al-Haidari (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	04/10/2020	0.40 \$75.00 \$30.00 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from F. Al-Haidari (3), K. Walton (2); Email to F. Al-Haidari (2)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	04/13/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from F. Al-Haidari (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	04/15/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from J. Ward (1), K. Walton (1), F. Al-Haidari (1)
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	04/16/2020	0.10 \$25.00 \$2.50 <i>Note:</i> Call with client
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeti	04/21/2020	1.00 \$75.00 \$75.00 <i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting (By Zoom)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	04/24/2020	0.85 \$75.00 \$63.75 <i>Note:</i> Review CRCP and GAL Report; Call with client
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	04/24/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from F. Al-Haidari (2), K. Walton (1); Email to F. Al-Haidari (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	04/27/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Review
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	04/27/2020	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75 <i>Note:</i> Call with client (2)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	04/27/2020	0.60 \$75.00 \$45.00 <i>Note:</i> Attend Hearing (By Zoom)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com	04/28/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note:</i> Letter 04-28-20
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	05/04/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review Letter from F. Al-Haidari
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	05/11/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review update letter from F. Al-Haidari (1)

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025170V34870
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/20/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from K. Walton (1), F. Al-Haidari (1)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/22/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to F. Al-Haidari (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Mesa (1), F. Al-Haidari</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/26/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Update Letter</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/28/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	<i>Note: Attend team meeting (By Zoom)</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/01/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Update Letter</i>	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/16/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and Review Update Letter</i>	

Expenses

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Postage	08/22/2019	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	08/22/2019	2.00	\$0.05	\$0.10
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies for 08-22-19 (2)</i>			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	10/22/2019	1.00	\$0.05	\$0.05
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies for 10-22-19 (1)</i>			
Postage	10/22/2019	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	11/15/2019	1.00	\$0.05	\$0.05
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies for 11-15-19 (1)</i>			
Postage	11/15/2019	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	01/22/2020	4.00	\$0.05	\$0.20
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies for 01-22-19 (4)</i>			
Postage	01/22/2020	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>			
Postage	04/28/2020	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	04/28/2020	5.00	\$0.05	\$0.25
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies for 4/28/20 (5)</i>			
			Total Paid:	1291.90

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025171V34880

Voucher: 34880

Status: 06/23/2020 Paid

Case ID: 10525

Docket: JV17-558

Client: Lynch, Jann

Business Unit: 6230

Object Code: 64125

Time

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	08/30/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> Email to N. Johnson (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/06/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to N. Johnson (1); Receive and review e-mail from N. Johnson (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/17/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from N. Johnson			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/18/2019	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00
	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to N. Johnson (1), M. Norrie (1); Receive and review e-mail from N. Johnson (1), M. Norrie (1), L. Car			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/19/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/20/2019	0.45	\$75.00	\$33.75
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (3), M. Norrie (2), S. Sidwell (1), N. Johnsc			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/21/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from L. Camplin (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/22/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Norrie (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/23/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to M. Norrie (1); Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/24/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to N. Johnson (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), N. Johnson			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	09/25/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> Call to client; E-mail to client (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Draft/Document Prepa	09/25/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50
	<i>Note:</i> Prepare, file, and serve Motion to Continue			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/25/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	09/27/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Granting Unopposed Motion to Continue Review			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com	10/03/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50
	<i>Note:</i> Letter to Client			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	10/17/2019	1.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
	<i>Note:</i> Review CRCP and GAL Report			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	10/18/2019	0.75	\$75.00	\$56.25
	<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing; Conference with client and N. Johnson			

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025171V34880			
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/23/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order of Review of Disposition; Order Discharging Legal Counsel; Order Placing Legal</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	10/29/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity: Correspondence/Com.</i>	<i>Note: Letter with attached order to client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/30/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to N. Johnson (2); Receive and review e-mail from N. Johnson (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/02/2020	0.25	\$75.00	\$18.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from N. Johnson (1), S. Sidwell (1), D. Kerr (1); E-mail to D. Kerr (1), S. Sidwell (</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/03/2020	0.35	\$75.00	\$26.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile C</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/07/2020	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	<i>Note: Prepare, file and serve Motion to Continue</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/09/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Granting Continuance</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/14/2020	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity: Correspondence/Com.</i>	<i>Note: Letter to Client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/04/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to N. Johnson (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/04/2020	0.75	\$75.00	\$56.25	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Review CRCP and GAL report</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/05/2020	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from N. Johnson (1) with attachment (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/05/2020	0.65	\$75.00	\$48.75	
<i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	<i>Note: Attend hearing</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/05/2020	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call with J. Bahn</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/12/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Court Order of Review</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/16/2020	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity: Correspondence/Com.</i>	<i>Note: Letter to Client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/11/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Email to N. Johnson (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/17/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and Review email from N. Johnson (1)</i>				

Expenses

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Postage	10/03/2019	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	10/03/2019	1.00	\$0.05	\$0.05
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies for 10-03/19 (1)</i>			

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025171V34880			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	10/29/2019	4.00	\$0.05	\$0.20	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies for 10-29-19 (4)</i>				
Postage	10/29/2019	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>				
Postage	01/14/2020	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>				
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	01/14/2020	1.00	\$0.05	\$0.05	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies for 01-14-20 (1)</i>				
			Total Paid:	605.85	

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025172V34883

Voucher: 34883

Status: 06/23/2020 Paid

Case ID: 11435

Docket: JV18-25

Client: Bridge, Tera

Business Unit: 6230

Object Code: 64125

Time

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	02/12/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review biweekly report
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	02/15/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review email from C. Nemeec (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meetii	02/21/2019	0.45	\$65.00	\$29.25
				<i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting; Conference with M. Mills
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/01/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail C. Nemeec (1)
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/06/2019	0.05	\$25.00	\$1.25
				<i>Note:</i> Email to Client (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/06/2019	0.25	\$65.00	\$16.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (3), L. Camplin (1), L. Bridge (1); E-mail to C. Nemeec (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/16/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from L. Johnson (1), C. Turner (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/18/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> E-mail to L. Johnson (1); Receive and review e-mail from L. Johnson (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/19/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (2)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	03/21/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Setting Team Meeting
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/21/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meetii	03/21/2019	0.65	\$65.00	\$42.25
				<i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/22/2019	0.45	\$65.00	\$29.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (4), L. Camplin (3), C. Tuner (2)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/24/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (1), L. Johnson (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/25/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (1), L. Johnson (1), L. Camplin (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/27/2019	0.20	\$65.00	\$13.00
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (2), L. Johnson (1), L. Camplin (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	03/28/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review bi-weekly report

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025172V34883
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/28/2019	0.40 \$65.00 \$26.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from L. Camplin (2), C. Turner (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), L. Johns</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/29/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec with attachment (1), L. Camplin (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	04/05/2019	0.15 \$65.00 \$9.75 <i>Note: Receive and review FCRO Report</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/07/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from L. Camplin (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	04/09/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Motion for Bridge Order</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/09/2019	0.40 \$65.00 \$26.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), C. Nemeec (1), L. Camplin (2), L. Johns</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	04/11/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review GAL report</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/15/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/15/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: E-mail to client (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	04/15/2019	0.40 \$65.00 \$26.00 <i>Note: Attend hearing; Conference with Parties</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	04/15/2019	0.20 \$65.00 \$13.00 <i>Note: Review CRCP</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	04/16/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order of Review</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/16/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/17/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/20/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	04/22/2019	0.15 \$65.00 \$9.75 <i>Note: Call with Client</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	04/22/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Call with M. Mills (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/22/2019	0.20 \$65.00 \$13.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (2); E-mail to C. Nemeec (2)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/23/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: Receive and review email from C. Nemeec (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/24/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (1)</i>

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025172V34883
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/25/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review email from C. Nemeec with attachment (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	04/26/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: Call to C. Nemeec</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	04/29/2019	0.15 \$65.00 \$9.75 <i>Note: Call with Nemeec</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/07/2019	0.35 \$65.00 \$22.75 <i>Note: E-mail to M. Mills (1), C. Nemeec (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (3), M. Mills (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/08/2019	0.20 \$65.00 \$13.00 <i>Note: E-mail to C. Nemeec (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (2)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/09/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (2)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	05/10/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: Receive and review Report from C. Nemeec (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/10/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: E-mail to C. Nemeec (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/13/2019	0.15 \$65.00 \$9.75 <i>Note: E-mail to C. Nemeec (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/16/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (1), C. Turner (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	05/16/2019	0.15 \$65.00 \$9.75 <i>Note: Call with Client</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/17/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Nemeec (1), L. Camplin (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/20/2019	0.05 \$65.00 \$3.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from L. Johnson (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	05/24/2019	0.15 \$65.00 \$9.75 <i>Note: Call with client</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	05/28/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Journal Entry and Order</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	05/28/2019	0.20 \$65.00 \$13.00 <i>Note: Review CRCP and GAL report</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/28/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: E-mail to C. Nemeec (1), C. Druepel (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Druepel (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	05/28/2019	0.75 \$65.00 \$48.75 <i>Note: Attend hearing; conference with client</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	05/28/2019	0.15 \$65.00 \$9.75 <i>Note: Call with client (2)</i>
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	05/29/2019	0.10 \$65.00 \$6.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Bridge Order</i>

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025172V34883

Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/05/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50
-------------------------	------------	------	---------	---------

Activity: Correspondence/Com. **Note:** Letter to Client

Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/06/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
-------------------------	------------	------	---------	--------

Activity: Phone Calls **Note:** Call with Client

Expenses

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	05/31/2019	6.00	\$0.05	\$0.30
Activity:	Note: Photo Copies May 2019			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	06/05/2019	5.00	\$0.05	\$0.25
Activity:	Note: June 2018 Photo Copies (5)			

Total Paid: 603.05

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025173V34884

Voucher: 34884

Status: 06/23/2020 Paid

Case ID: 9623

Docket: JV17-323

Client: Keagle, Katie

Business Unit: 6230

Object Code: 64125

Time

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing;	10/05/2018	1.00	\$65.00	\$65.00
				<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of;	10/05/2018	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50
				<i>Note:</i> Review GAL report and CRCP
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of;	10/16/2018	0.15	\$65.00	\$9.75
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Disposition on Count II; Order of Review on Count I: Notice of Review Hearing
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing;	10/26/2018	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Attend Hearing
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/26/2018	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> E-mail to parties (1); Receive and review e-mail from G. Steen (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/29/2018	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review email from S. Sidwell (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/02/2018	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/05/2018	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/15/2018	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Draft/Document Prepa	11/19/2018	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50
				<i>Note:</i> Prepare, file, and serve Motion to Continue and Proposed Order
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of;	11/27/2018	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Granting Motion to Continue
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/20/2019	0.05	\$25.00	\$1.25
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Simon (1)
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/25/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50
				<i>Note:</i> E-mail to C. Simon (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Simon (1), H. Messerschmidt (1), S. Sidwell (1), C
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	03/25/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Call with client
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/26/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile C
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	03/27/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50
				<i>Note:</i> Call with Client
Attorney Time - \$65.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/27/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50
				<i>Note:</i> E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1), T. Bird (1), G.

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025173V34884			
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/28/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile C</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	03/29/2019	0.20	\$65.00	\$13.00	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2); Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1), G. St</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/01/2019	0.40	\$65.00	\$26.00	
<i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	<i>Note: Prepare, file, and serve Motion to Continue (in JV17-323, JV18-71, & CI17-2963)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/01/2019	0.35	\$65.00	\$22.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), G. Steen (3), T. Bird (1), C. Simon (1);</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/04/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Granting Motion to Continue Hearing on Complaint</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	04/08/2019	0.05	\$65.00	\$3.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/16/2019	0.40	\$65.00	\$26.00	
<i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	<i>Note: Prepare Stipulation and Bridge Order</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/17/2019	0.75	\$65.00	\$48.75	
<i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	<i>Note: Prepare Stipulation and Bridge Order</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	05/21/2019	1.35	\$65.00	\$87.75	
<i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	<i>Note: Attend hearing; conference with client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/11/2019	0.30	\$65.00	\$19.50	
<i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i>	<i>Note: Letter to Client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/11/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Signed Stipulated Order of Paternity</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/11/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Decree Establishing Paternity, Custody, and Parenting Time</i>				
Attorney Time - \$65.00	06/11/2019	0.10	\$65.00	\$6.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order of Review; Order Terminating Jurisdiction; Order Relieving NDHHS of Responsibi</i>				

Expenses

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount	
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	06/01/2019	3.00	\$0.05	\$0.15	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies (3)</i>				
Postage	06/01/2019	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>				

Total Paid: 486.15

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025174V34892

Voucher: 34892

Status: 06/23/2020 Paid

Case ID: 17599

Docket: JV19-437

Client: Blume, Erica

Business Unit: 6230

Object Code: 64125

Time

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	09/06/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order continuing Hearing			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	09/06/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Appointing Counsel			
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	09/12/2019	0.20	\$25.00	\$5.00
	<i>Note:</i> Review discovery			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Other	09/12/2019	0.50	\$75.00	\$37.50
	<i>Note:</i> Open office file			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	09/30/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/01/2019	0.40	\$75.00	\$30.00
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from W. McEwen (1), D. Langdon (2), M. Burton (1), H. Colton (3), H. Messersch			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	10/04/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Motion to Continue			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/04/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	10/04/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Granting Continuance			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/07/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from W. McEwen with attachment (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	10/17/2019	0.90	\$75.00	\$67.50
	<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing; Conference with client; Conference with Parties			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	10/28/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Progression Order			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	10/28/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Adjudication of Jurisdiction under Neb. Rev. Stat. 43-247(3A) on Count II of the Petition,			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/06/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Notice of Acknowledgment of Right to Intervene			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/19/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	11/20/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25
	<i>Note:</i> Call to client; E-mail to H. Colton (1); Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	11/20/2019	1.25	\$75.00	\$93.75
	<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing			

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025174V34892
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/20/2019 <i>Note:</i> Review CRCP and GAL Report	1.00 \$75.00 \$75.00
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/22/2019 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Continuing Hearing	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	12/02/2019 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1), M. Burton (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), M. Polank	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	12/03/2019 <i>Note:</i> Attend hearing	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	12/06/2019 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Adjudication of Jurisdiction	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	12/30/2019 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from S. Dunham (1)	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/03/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	01/07/2020 <i>Note:</i> Review CRCP	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	01/08/2020 <i>Note:</i> Review CRCP	1.75 \$75.00 \$131.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/08/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1), D. Langdon (1)	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	01/08/2020 <i>Note:</i> Attend hearing; Conference with client	1.35 \$75.00 \$101.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/09/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (2)	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/14/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (2), M. Poland (1)	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/15/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	01/17/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Disposition	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/21/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1), D. Langdon (1), H. Messerschmidt (1)	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/22/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	01/24/2020 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	02/04/2020 <i>Note:</i> E-mail to H. Colton (3); Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (3)	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Meeting with	02/04/2020 <i>Note:</i> Conference with client	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025174V34892
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/05/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Attending Team Meeting</i>	02/25/2020	1.00 \$75.00 \$75.00 <i>Note: Attend team meeting</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	03/06/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order Setting Hearing</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/09/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (2), D. Langdon (1), K. Lauenroth (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/09/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail with attachment from D. Gardner (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/11/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from K. Lauenroth (1), D. Langdon (1), M. Poland (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/12/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1), H. Colton (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/18/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	03/23/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order Continuing Team Meeting and Hearing on Motion</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/23/2020	0.45 \$75.00 \$33.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1), M. Poland (2), M. Burton (2), Lancaster County Juvenile Court</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/24/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (3); E-mail to H. Colton (3)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	03/25/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order Approving Emergency Placement Change</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/25/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (2), D. Langdon (1), M. Poland (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	03/25/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Motion and Affidavit for Emergency Placement Change</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Research on:</i>	03/26/2020	0.90 \$75.00 \$67.50 <i>Note: Review file and Legal research; E-mail to H. Colton (1); Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	03/27/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order for Hearing</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	03/27/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Motion for Hearing on Placement Change</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	03/31/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Review discovery</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/31/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), H. Colton (1), H. Messerschmidt (2), M</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	04/01/2020	1.25 \$75.00 \$93.75 <i>Note: Attend Hearing</i>

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025174V34892			
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/02/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Recive and review Order Continuing Review Hearing				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/02/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order for Continuing Hearing on Motion for Placement Change				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/03/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Recive and review Order Continuing Hearing on Motion for New Counsel				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/03/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Review Police Report; Review file				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/03/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), M. Poland (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/06/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/07/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/08/2020	0.50	\$75.00	\$37.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from D. Langdon (2), M. Poland (3), E. Exstrom (1), H. Colton (1), T. Dinneen (1),				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/09/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/10/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt with attachment (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/14/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/14/2020	0.70	\$75.00	\$52.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meetii	<i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting (by Zoom)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/15/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (2)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/16/2020	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (2), T. Dinneen (2)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/17/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Dinneen (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/21/2020	0.70	\$75.00	\$52.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (6), H. Colton (1), T. Dinneen (1), E. Exstrom (2), A. Velder (2); E				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/27/2020	0.45	\$75.00	\$33.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Review caselaw and file; Prepare for hearing				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/27/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1), E. Exstrom (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/27/2020	0.25	\$75.00	\$18.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), J. Judds (1), H. Colton (1), H. Messer:				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/28/2020	1.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Review caselaw and file; Prepare for hearing				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025174V34892
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/28/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from E. Exstrom (1), M. Poland (2), T. Dinneen (2), A. Velder (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/29/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (3), M. Poland (1); E-mail to H. Colton (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	04/29/2020	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75 <i>Note: Call with H. Colton</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	04/29/2020	0.75 \$75.00 \$56.25 <i>Note: Attend Hearing (By Zoom)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	05/05/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order Sustaining Motion for Placement Change</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/11/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (2), H. Colton (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	05/13/2020	0.40 \$75.00 \$30.00 <i>Note: Prepare for hearing; review file</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/13/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: E-mail to H. Messerschmidt (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/14/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (2)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/15/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Coufal (1), D. Langdon (1), T. Dinneen (1), H. Colton (1), E. Exstrom (1);</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/20/2020	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75 <i>Note: E-mail to M. Poland (1); Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1), D. Langdon (1), M. Poland (;</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/28/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1); E-mail to M. Poland (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	06/01/2020	0.55 \$75.00 \$41.25 <i>Note: Review CRCP and GAL report</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/01/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note: E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), H. Colton (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster Cou</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	06/01/2020	0.85 \$75.00 \$63.75 <i>Note: Attend hearing (By Zoom) (2)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	06/09/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order of Review</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/10/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/11/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1); Review file</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/17/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1), M. Coufal (1), D. Buckley (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/18/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (1), K. Belgum (1), D. Buckley (1); E-mail to M. Poland (1)</i>

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025174V34892		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/19/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/19/2020	0.45	\$75.00	\$33.75
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Colton (5), M. Poland (1); E-mail to H. Colton (3)</i>			

Total Paid: 2060.00

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025175V34901

Voucher: 34901

Status: 06/23/2020 Paid

Case ID: 11190

Docket: JV17-711

Client: Meyer, Curtis

Business Unit: 6230

Object Code: 64125

Time

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	09/30/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), C. Roberts (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	10/01/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25
	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from K. Walton (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to K. Walton (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	10/02/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25
	<i>Note: Receive and reievew e-mail from Lancaster County District Court (2), M. Lamski (1), S. Flynn (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	10/03/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Transferring to Judge Linda Porter; Order Advancing Review of Disposition and C</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	11/13/2019	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00
	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (1), A. Gordin (1), C. Roberts (1), J. McNeil (2)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	11/14/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50
	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (2), T. Vacek (2), K. Walton (1), A. Gordin (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	11/18/2019	0.25	\$75.00	\$18.75
	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (2), M. Lamski (1), C. Roberts (1), A. Gordin (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	11/19/2019	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00
	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from K. Walton (1), S. Flynn (1), J. McNeil (1); E-mail to S. Flynn (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	11/20/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25
	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (1), A. Gordin (1), C. Roberts (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	11/20/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note: Receive and review Motion to Change Schools</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	12/10/2019	0.75	\$75.00	\$56.25
	<i>Note: Attend hearing</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	12/10/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (1), A. Gordin (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	12/11/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note: Receive and review Order; Notice of Review Hearing, Permanency Planning Hearing, and Child Support He</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i>	12/16/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50
	<i>Note: Letter to client</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	12/18/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	12/18/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25
	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (2), A. Gordin (1)</i>			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	12/19/2019	1.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
	<i>Note: Attend hearing</i>			

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025175V34901			
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/20/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Sustaining Motion for Change of School</i>				
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	12/20/2019	0.05	\$25.00	\$1.25	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Phone call with client's family</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/23/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i>	<i>Note: Letter to client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/30/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to T. Vacek (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/30/2019	0.25	\$75.00	\$18.75	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call with G. McKewon</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/07/2020	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call with G. McKewon</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/09/2020	0.50	\$75.00	\$37.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (4), T. Vacek (2), A. Gordin (1), G. McKeown (1), K. Walton (1); E-r</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/10/2020	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (2), T. Vacek (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/12/2020	1.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	<i>Note: Attend team meeting</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/26/2020	0.85	\$75.00	\$63.75	
<i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	<i>Note: Attend hearing; Conference with Parties</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/28/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order of Review</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/04/2020	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i>	<i>Note: Letter to client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/20/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/23/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from S. Flynn (1), T. Vacek (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/07/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/09/2020	0.65	\$75.00	\$48.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (4), S. Flynn (2), T. Vacek (2), J. McNeil (2)</i>				
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	04/10/2020	0.70	\$25.00	\$17.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Review visitation notes; Notes to file</i>				
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	04/10/2020	0.10	\$25.00	\$2.50	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call to G. McKewon</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/14/2020	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), M. Lamski (1), J. McNeil (1), K. Walton (1), S. Flynn (1); Email</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/17/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Continuing Review Hearing</i>				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025175V34901			
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/17/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Motion and Affidavit for Change of Placement				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/17/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Approving Placement Change				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/20/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com:	<i>Note:</i> Letter 04-17-20				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/20/2020	0.35	\$75.00	\$26.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (3), K. Walton (2), A. Gordin (1); E-mail to T. Vacek (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/27/2020	0.90	\$75.00	\$67.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeti	<i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting (By Zoom)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/10/2020	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), J. McNeil (1), M. Glendening (1), K. Walton (1), A. Kuntz (1); E				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/15/2020	0.85	\$75.00	\$63.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeti	<i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting (By Zoom)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/17/2020	0.25	\$75.00	\$18.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to M. Lamski (2); Receive and review e-mail from M. Lamski (1), C. Roberts (1), A. Kuntz (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/18/2020	0.75	\$75.00	\$56.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Kuntz (3), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), M. Lamski (3), J. McNeil				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/19/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/19/2020	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Draft/Document Prepa	<i>Note:</i> Prepare, file, and serve Motion to Continue				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/19/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	<i>Note:</i> Call with G. McKeown				

Expenses

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	12/16/2019	3.00	\$0.05	\$0.15
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Photo Copies for 12-16-19 (3)			
Postage	12/16/2019	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			
Postage	12/23/2019	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	12/23/2019	3.00	\$0.05	\$0.15
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Photo Copies for 12-23-19 (3)			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	03/04/2020	5.00	\$0.05	\$0.25
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Photo Copies for 03-04-20 (5)			
Postage	03/04/2020	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	04/20/2020	2.00	\$0.05	\$0.10
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Photo Copies for 04-17-20 (2)			

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025175V34901
Postage	04/20/2020	0.50 \$1.00 \$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>	

Total Paid: 1025.30

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025176V34902

Voucher: 34902

Status: 06/23/2020 Paid

Case ID: 17655

Docket: JV18-102

Client: Wilson, Orlando

Business Unit: 6230

Object Code: 64125

Time

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	09/13/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Appointing Counsel			
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	09/19/2019	0.20	\$25.00	\$5.00
	<i>Note:</i> Review Pleadings and Orders			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Other	09/19/2019	0.50	\$75.00	\$37.50
	<i>Note:</i> Open office file			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com	09/20/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50
	<i>Note:</i> Letter to client			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/04/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	10/08/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25
	<i>Note:</i> Call with client			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Meeting with	10/17/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25
	<i>Note:</i> Conference with T. Vacek			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/17/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to T. Vacek			
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	10/28/2019	0.10	\$25.00	\$2.50
	<i>Note:</i> Call with client			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/14/2019	0.35	\$75.00	\$26.25
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (3), C. Hermsen (2), D. Buckley (1), K. Belgum (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/15/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1), S. Sidwell (1), D. Buckley (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/19/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review email from S. Sidwell (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/19/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Advancing Hearings			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/20/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to T. Vacek (1); Receive and review e-mail from T. Vacek (1)			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/21/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to T. Vacek (1)			
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	11/22/2019	0.15	\$25.00	\$3.75
	<i>Note:</i> Phone call with client			
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com	11/22/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50
	<i>Note:</i> Letter to client			

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025176V34902
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/25/2019	1.00 \$75.00 \$75.00
<i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeting	<i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/25/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/26/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from FCRO (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/26/2019	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	<i>Note:</i> Call to client's family	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/26/2019	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity:</i> Draft/Document Prepa	<i>Note:</i> Prepare, file, and serve Motion for Transport	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	11/27/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order to Transport	
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	11/27/2019	0.10 \$25.00 \$2.50
<i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	<i>Note:</i> Call to LSO	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/02/2019	0.85 \$75.00 \$63.75
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Review CRCP, FCRO Report, and GAL Report	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/03/2019	0.80 \$75.00 \$60.00
<i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing; conference with client	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/09/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Review of Disposition	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/09/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Regarding Permnanacy Plan	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/11/2019	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com	<i>Note:</i> Letter to client	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/18/2019	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com	<i>Note:</i> Letter to client; Review file	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/19/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/19/2019	0.80 \$75.00 \$60.00
<i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeti	<i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting	
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	12/19/2019	0.05 \$25.00 \$1.25
<i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	<i>Note:</i> Phone call with client	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/30/2019	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)	
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	12/30/2019	0.05 \$25.00 \$1.25
<i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	<i>Note:</i> Phone call with client	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/02/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to E. Wilson (1)	
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	01/02/2020	0.10 \$25.00 \$2.50
<i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	<i>Note:</i> Phone call with E. Wilson	

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025176V34902
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/09/2020 <i>Note: E-mail to T. Vacek (1)</i>	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	01/09/2020 <i>Note: Call with client</i>	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/10/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (6), V. Gorden (2), C. Zegers (4), S. Sidwell (2) ; E-mail to M. Harr</i>	0.75 \$75.00 \$56.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/13/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), C. Zegers (1)</i>	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/14/2020 <i>Note: E-mail to M. Harris (1); Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1)</i>	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	01/14/2020 <i>Note: Call with E. Wilson</i>	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/15/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1); E-mail to M. Harris (1)</i>	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	01/15/2020 <i>Note: Attend team meeting</i>	0.90 \$75.00 \$67.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	01/23/2020 <i>Note: Prepare, file, and serve Motion to Transport</i>	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	01/24/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review Order Denying Motion to Transport</i>	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/27/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)</i>	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/29/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review-mail from E. Wilson (1)</i>	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/30/2020 <i>Note: E-mail to E. Wilson (1)</i>	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	01/31/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail M. Harris (1); E-mail to M. Harris (1)</i>	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/04/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)</i>	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/05/2020 <i>Note: E-mail to M. Harris (3); Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (2)</i>	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	02/05/2020 <i>Note: Call with client</i>	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/06/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1); E-mail to M. Harris (1), E. Wilson (1)</i>	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/12/2020 <i>Note: E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1), E. Wilson (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster Cou</i>	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/17/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)</i>	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025176V34902
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/18/2020	0.45 \$75.00 \$33.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), V. Gorden (1), S. Sidwell (2), E. Wilson (2), S. Sidwell (1); E-n</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/18/2020	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), V. Gorden (1), S. Sidwell (1), E. Wilson (2); E-mail to M. Harris</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	02/19/2020	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25 <i>Note: Review CRCP</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/19/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: E-mail to E. Wilson (1); Receive and review email from E. Wilson (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	02/21/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order of Review</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	02/21/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order Regarding Exception Hearing; Determination of an Exception</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Meeting with</i>	02/21/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Conference with E. Wilson</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	02/21/2020	1.00 \$75.00 \$75.00 <i>Note: Attend hearing</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Attending Team Meetin</i>	02/21/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50 <i>Note: Attend team meeting</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/24/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review email from M. Harris (1), V. Gorden (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/25/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review email from M. Harris (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i>	02/25/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note: Letter to client</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/26/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (2); E-mail to E. Wilson (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/02/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), S. Sidwell (1); E-mail to M. Harris (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/03/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), V. Gorden (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/04/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), S. Sidwell (1) E. Wilson (1); E-mail to E. Wilson (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/16/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (2), V. Gordon (1), E. Wilson (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/17/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (2), V. Gorden (1), M. Harris (1), A. Haytr (1)</i>
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	03/18/2020	0.05 \$25.00 \$1.25 <i>Note: Phone call with client</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/20/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: E-mail to E. Wilson (1); Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), E. Wilson (1)</i>

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025176V34902			
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/21/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1), V. Gorden (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/23/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Recive and review e-mail from B. Storer (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/23/2020	0.35	\$75.00	\$26.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (2), V. Gorden (2), S. Sidwell (1), C. Zegers (1); E-mail to M. Harri				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/24/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from J. Gilgore (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/27/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Continuing Hearing				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/27/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to E. Wilson (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/28/2020	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com.	<i>Note:</i> Letter 04-28-20				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/30/2020	0.25	\$75.00	\$18.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	<i>Note:</i> Call with client				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	04/30/2020	0.45	\$75.00	\$33.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Review file; E-mail to M. Harris (1), OCC Caseworker (1), J. Gilgore (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/04/2020	0.35	\$75.00	\$26.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from V. Nicholas (2), E. Wilson (1); E-mail to E. Wilson (2), V. Nicholas (2)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/13/2020	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Review of:	<i>Note:</i> Review the FCRO Report				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/13/2020	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to M. Harris (2); Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (2)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/14/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), C. Zegers (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/15/2020	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from S. Sidwell (1), V. Gorden (1), M. Harris (1); E-mail to M. Harris (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/20/2020	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Research on:	<i>Note:</i> Research; review file				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/20/2020	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to M. Harris (2); Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (2)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/21/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/26/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	05/27/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to E. Wilson (1)				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/01/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025176V34902
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/03/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to E. Wilson (1), M. Harris (1); Receive and Review email from E. Wilson (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/04/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Review file; E-mail to E. Wilson (1); Receive and review e-mail from M. Harris (1), E. Wilson (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/10/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from E. Wilson (1)	
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/11/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity:</i> Emailing	<i>Note:</i> E-mail to E. Wilson (1)	

Expenses

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	09/19/2019	127.00	\$0.05	\$6.35
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Photo Copies of Pleadings and Orders (127)			
Postage	09/20/2019	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	11/22/2019	1.00	\$0.05	\$0.05
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Photo Copies for 11-22-19 (1)			
Postage	11/22/2019	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	12/12/2019	6.00	\$0.05	\$0.30
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Photo Copies for 12-12-19 (6)			
Postage	12/12/2019	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	12/19/2019	4.00	\$0.05	\$0.20
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Photo Copies for 12-19-19 (4)			
Postage	12/19/2019	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	02/25/2020	6.00	\$0.05	\$0.30
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Photo Copies for 02-25-20 (6)			
Postage	02/25/2020	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			
Postage	04/28/2020	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Postage			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	04/28/2020	1.00	\$0.05	\$0.05
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note:</i> Photo Copies for 04-28-20 (1)			

Total Paid: 1511.95

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025177V34906

Voucher: 34906

Status: 06/23/2020 Paid

Case ID: 18284

Docket: JV19-552

Client: Witter, Sandra

Business Unit: 6230

Object Code: 64125

Time

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/06/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Appointing Counsel
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/06/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Continuing Hearing on the Petition
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/08/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from D. Volentine (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Other	11/08/2019	0.50	\$75.00	\$37.50
				<i>Note:</i> Open office file
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com.	11/11/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50
				<i>Note:</i> Letter to Client
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/15/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review email from H. Messerschmidt (1), D. Volentine (1)
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	11/15/2019	0.10	\$25.00	\$2.50
				<i>Note:</i> Phone call with client.
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/18/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> E-mail to D. Volentine (1); Receive and review email from C. Martin (1)
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	11/18/2019	0.05	\$25.00	\$1.25
				<i>Note:</i> Phone call with client
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	11/19/2019	1.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
				<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing; Conference with client
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/19/2019	0.75	\$25.00	\$18.75
				<i>Note:</i> Review discovery
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/20/2019	1.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
				<i>Note:</i> Review discovery videos
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/21/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Setting Progression Order
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/21/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Denial; Order Setting Count I of the Petition for Docket Call and Formal
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/21/2019	1.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
				<i>Note:</i> Review discovery videos
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Correspondence/Com.	11/22/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50
				<i>Note:</i> Letter to Client
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	11/26/2019	0.40	\$75.00	\$30.00
				<i>Note:</i> E-mail to H. Messerschmidt (2), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from C. Bic

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025177V34906			
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/03/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/05/2019	0.25	\$75.00	\$18.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to H. Messerschmidt (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from J. Juc</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/09/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call to client (2)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/09/2019	0.30	\$75.00	\$22.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to M. Paxton (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2); Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine</i>				
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	12/09/2019	0.15	\$25.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Phone call with client (3)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/10/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order Granting Motion to Cancel DC</i>				
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	12/10/2019	0.05	\$25.00	\$1.25	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call to client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/10/2019	0.45	\$75.00	\$33.75	
<i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	<i>Note: Prepare, file, and serve Motion to Cancel DC and Proposed Order</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/20/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/26/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/27/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call with client</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/27/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to M. Paxton (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/28/2019	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/30/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to H. Messerschmidt (1); Receive and review e-mail from C. Martin (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/31/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine (1), H. Messerschmidt (1); E-mail to H. Messerschmidt (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/02/2020	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2); E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile C</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/09/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call with client</i>				
Paralegal Time - \$25.00	01/15/2020	0.05	\$25.00	\$1.25	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Phone call with client (2)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/17/2020	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25	
<i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	<i>Note: Attend Hearing</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/17/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)</i>				

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025177V34906
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	01/17/2020 <i>Note: Call with client</i>	0.10 \$25.00 \$2.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	01/21/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review Order Continuing Hearing on the Petition</i>	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	01/21/2020 <i>Note: Attend Hearing</i>	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	01/31/2020 <i>Note: Attend hearing; Conference with Client</i>	0.85 \$75.00 \$63.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/11/2020 <i>Note: E-mail to H. Messerschmidt (1), D. Vollentine (1), Client (1); Receive and review e-mail from S. Morrow (1),</i>	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	02/11/2020 <i>Note: Call with client(1)</i>	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Correspondence/Com.</i>	02/11/2020 <i>Note: Letter to Client</i>	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	02/11/2020 <i>Note: Phone call with client (2)</i>	0.10 \$25.00 \$2.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	02/12/2020 <i>Note: Call with Client</i>	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/13/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine (1), Client (1)</i>	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/14/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Client (2); E-mail to client (1), D. Vollentine (1)</i>	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	02/18/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine (1)</i>	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	03/03/2020 <i>Note: Phone call with client (2)</i>	0.10 \$25.00 \$2.50
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	03/04/2020 <i>Note: Phone call with client (3)</i>	0.10 \$25.00 \$2.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti</i>	03/05/2020 <i>Note: Attend team meeting</i>	0.75 \$75.00 \$56.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/16/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine (1), H. Messerschmidt (1); E-mail to D. Vollentine (1)</i>	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	03/16/2020 <i>Note: Call with client</i>	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/17/2020 <i>Note: E-mail to D. Vollentine (1); Receive and review e-mail from D. Vollentine (2), C. Bice (1), J. Juds (1)</i>	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	03/17/2020 <i>Note: Call with client</i>	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa</i>	03/18/2020 <i>Note: Prepare, file, and serve Motion to Continue</i>	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025177V34906
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/18/2020	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75 <i>Note: E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2); Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1), Lanca</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/21/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/22/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/23/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note: E-mail to Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1); Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile C</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	03/25/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review Order Granting Motion to Continue</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i>	03/25/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note: Letter to client</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/25/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	03/31/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/01/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	04/01/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Call to H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	04/02/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Call to H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/02/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	04/03/2020	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25 <i>Note: Call with H. Vorderstrasse</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	04/10/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Call with Client</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/13/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2), D. Vollentine (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/14/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1) *</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/15/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (2); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/27/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/28/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (1); E-mail to H. Vorderstrasse (1), Lancaster County Juvenile Cc</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/04/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1), M. Paxton (1)</i>

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025177V34906
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	05/04/2020 <i>Note: Call with Client</i>	0.10 \$25.00 \$2.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/05/2020 <i>Note: E-mail to M. Paxton (1) *</i>	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	05/06/2020 <i>Note: Review CRCP and GAL Report</i>	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/06/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Paxton (2), H. Vorderstrasse (1), H. Messerschmidt (1), Lancaster Coun</i>	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	05/06/2020 <i>Note: Call with Client</i>	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	05/07/2020 <i>Note: Review CRCP and GAL Report</i>	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/07/2020 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from H. Vorderstrasse (1), M. Paxton (2); Email to H. Vorderstrasse (2), M. Paxtc</i>	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	05/07/2020 <i>Note: Call with Client (2)</i>	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	05/07/2020 <i>Note: Attend hearing (via Zoom)</i>	0.70 \$75.00 \$52.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	05/12/2020 <i>Note: Call with H. Vorderstrasse</i>	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	05/15/2020 <i>Note: Receive and Review Order of Disposition</i>	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Correspondence/Com</i>	05/15/2020 <i>Note: Letter to Client</i>	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	05/29/2020 <i>Note: Call with H. Vorderstrasse</i>	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75

Expenses

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Copies or Faxes at \$.05 <i>Activity:</i>	11/08/2019 <i>Note: Photo Copies (1) for 11/8/2019</i>	1.00	\$0.05	\$0.05
Postage <i>Activity:</i>	11/20/2019 <i>Note: Postage</i>	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
Copies or Faxes at \$.05 <i>Activity:</i>	11/21/2019 <i>Note: Photo Copies (3) for 11/21/2019</i>	3.00	\$0.05	\$0.15
Postage <i>Activity:</i>	11/22/2019 <i>Note: Postage</i>	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
Postage <i>Activity:</i>	01/17/2020 <i>Note: Postage</i>	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50
Copies or Faxes at \$.05 <i>Activity:</i>	01/17/2020 <i>Note: Photo Copies (3) for 1/17/2020</i>	3.00	\$0.05	\$0.15

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025177V34906			
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	02/10/2020	6.00	\$0.05	\$0.30	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies (6) for 2/10/2020</i>				
Postage	02/11/2020	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>				
Postage	03/25/2020	0.50	\$1.00	\$0.50	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>				
Postage	05/19/2020	0.65	\$1.00	\$0.65	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Postage</i>				
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	05/19/2020	7.00	\$0.05	\$0.35	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies (7) for 5/19/2020</i>				
Copies or Faxes at \$.05	05/19/2020	3.00	\$0.05	\$0.15	
<i>Activity:</i>	<i>Note: Photo Copies (3) for 3/25/2020</i>				
			Total Paid:	1224.45	

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice

Code: 67954

Reference # LACS0623201025178V34907

Voucher: 34907

Status: 06/23/2020 Paid

Case ID: 17869

Docket: JV19-523

Client: Landry Children

Business Unit: 6230

Object Code: 64125

Time

Category	Date	Qty	Rate	Amount
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	10/01/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order Appointing Counsel
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	10/02/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Journal Entry and Order
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	10/02/2019	0.15	\$75.00	\$11.25
				<i>Note:</i> Review file
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Other	10/02/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Order for Genetic Testing
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	10/02/2019	0.90	\$75.00	\$67.50
				<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Other	10/03/2019	0.50	\$75.00	\$37.50
				<i>Note:</i> Open office file
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	10/11/2019	0.15	\$25.00	\$3.75
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and Review discovery
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	10/23/2019	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from A. Osborn (2), J. Watkins (1), M. Lamski (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Other	10/29/2019	0.35	\$75.00	\$26.25
				<i>Note:</i> Travel to and from GAL visit
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Home Visit	10/29/2019	1.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
				<i>Note:</i> Attend GAL visit
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	11/01/2019	0.55	\$75.00	\$41.25
				<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/01/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Journal Entry and Order
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	11/04/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Adjudication of Jurisdiction
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Meeting with	12/04/2019	0.70	\$75.00	\$52.50
				<i>Note:</i> Attend predisposition meeting
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	12/04/2019	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50
				<i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from L. Johnson (1), M. Lamski (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	12/08/2019	1.45	\$75.00	\$108.75
				<i>Note:</i> Review CRCP and file
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	12/09/2019	0.70	\$75.00	\$52.50
				<i>Note:</i> Attend hearing

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025178V34907
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/09/2019	1.35 \$75.00 \$101.25
<i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa Note: Prepare, file and serve GAL report; Review CRCP</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/11/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of: Note: Receive and review Order of Disposition</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	12/17/2019	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of: Note: Receive and review Bi-weekly report</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/06/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/08/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/21/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/23/2020	0.75 \$75.00 \$56.25
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti Note: Attend team meeting</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/29/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50
<i>Activity: Emailing Note: Receive and review e-mail from Lancaster County Juvenile Court (2), A. Osborn (1), L. Johnson (1), M. Lam</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/30/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50
<i>Activity: Review of: Note: Receive and review Order granting Continuance</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/30/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00
<i>Activity: Emailing Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (2), Lancaster County JV Court (1), L. Johnson (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	01/31/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/10/2020	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75
<i>Activity: Emailing Note: Receive and review e-mail from M. Lamski (1), T. Hansen (2), C. Cooke (1); E-mail to T. Hansen (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/10/2020	1.10 \$75.00 \$82.50
<i>Activity: Phone Calls Note: Call with C. Cooke</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/11/2020	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75
<i>Activity: Emailing Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (3), M. Lamski (1), A. Osborn (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/12/2020	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25
<i>Activity: Emailing Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (4), L. Johnson (1), A. Osborn (1); E-mail to T. Hansen (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/20/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50
<i>Activity: Attending Team Meeti Note: Attend team meeting</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	02/20/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing Note: E-mail to L. Johnson (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/02/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75
<i>Activity: Emailing Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/08/2020	0.45 \$75.00 \$33.75
<i>Activity: Review of: Note: Review CRCP</i>		
Attorney Time - \$75.00	03/09/2020	1.30 \$75.00 \$97.50
<i>Activity: Draft/Document Prepa Note: Prepare, file, and serve GAL report; Review file and CRCP</i>		

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System
Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025178V34907
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/09/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Hearing:	03/10/2020	1.20 \$75.00 \$90.00 <i>Note:</i> Attend hearing (SJB for CCW)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	03/11/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Review
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/11/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (2), L. Johnson (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/12/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (2), L. Johnson (1), A. Osborn (1)
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	03/12/2020	0.50 \$25.00 \$12.50 <i>Note:</i> Review visitation notes
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	03/13/2020	0.50 \$25.00 \$12.50 <i>Note:</i> Review visitation notes; Notes to file
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/17/2020	0.15 \$75.00 \$11.25 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from H. Messerschmidt (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	03/24/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review Order of Child Support (2)
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity:</i> Review of:	03/25/2020	1.00 \$25.00 \$25.00 <i>Note:</i> Review visitation notes; Notes to file
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/27/2020	0.45 \$75.00 \$33.75 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (4), Lancaster County Juvenile Court (3), L. Johnson (2); E-mail to
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	03/30/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen with attachment (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	03/31/2020	0.25 \$75.00 \$18.75 <i>Note:</i> Call with S. Hardesty
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	04/01/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	04/01/2020	0.80 \$75.00 \$60.00 <i>Note:</i> Call with C. Cooke
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	04/02/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (1), T. Hansen (1); E-mail to C. Cooke (2), T. Hansen (1)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	04/02/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note:</i> Call to witness
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Attending Team Meeti	04/02/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50 <i>Note:</i> Attend team meeting (via Zoom)
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Phone Calls	04/03/2020	0.40 \$75.00 \$30.00 <i>Note:</i> Call with J. Sloan
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity:</i> Emailing	04/06/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note:</i> Receive and review e-mail from M. Poland (1), S. Hardesty (2)

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025178V34907
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/22/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (3), M. Lamski (2); E-mail to T. Hansen (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/23/2020	0.45 \$75.00 \$33.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (3), L. Johnson (2), A. Osborn (1), M. Lamski (2); E-mail to T. Ha</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	04/27/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen with attachment (2)</i>
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	04/29/2020	2.40 \$25.00 \$60.00 <i>Note: Review visitation notes</i>
Paralegal Time - \$25.00 <i>Activity: Review of:</i>	04/30/2020	1.40 \$25.00 \$35.00 <i>Note: Review visitation notes</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/07/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1); E-mail to T. Hansen (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/08/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/12/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (2)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Attending Team Meetii</i>	05/14/2020	0.50 \$75.00 \$37.50 <i>Note: Attend team meeting (By Zoom)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/19/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/20/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from L. Johnson (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/26/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/26/2020	0.40 \$75.00 \$30.00 <i>Note: E-mail to S. Betta Cole (3); Receive and review e-mail from S. Betta Cole (2); Review file</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/27/2020	0.30 \$75.00 \$22.50 <i>Note: E-mail to T. Hansen (3); Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (3)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/28/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: E-mail to C. Cooke (1); Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	05/29/2020	0.10 \$75.00 \$7.50 <i>Note: E-mail to C. Cooke (1); Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/01/2020	0.20 \$75.00 \$15.00 <i>Note: E-mail to C. Cooke (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (2)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Emailing</i>	06/02/2020	0.05 \$75.00 \$3.75 <i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (1)</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	06/02/2020	0.75 \$75.00 \$56.25 <i>Note: Call with C. Cooke</i>
Attorney Time - \$75.00 <i>Activity: Home Visit</i>	06/02/2020	0.35 \$75.00 \$26.25 <i>Note: Attend GAL visit (By Zoom)</i>

Lancaster Assigned Counsel System

Voucher Detail

Provider: Wooster, Candice	Code: 67954	Reference # LACS0623201025178V34907			
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/03/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Osborn (1), T. Hansen (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/09/2020	1.60	\$75.00	\$120.00	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Review CRCP; Prepare, file, and serve GAL report; Call to D. McMillan</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/09/2020	0.20	\$75.00	\$15.00	
<i>Activity: Phone Calls</i>	<i>Note: Call with C. Cooke</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/09/2020	0.05	\$75.00	\$3.75	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from A. Hallberg (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/10/2020	0.65	\$75.00	\$48.75	
<i>Activity: Hearing:</i>	<i>Note: Attend hearing (By Zoom)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/10/2020	0.95	\$75.00	\$71.25	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review e-mail from T. Hansen (5) with attachments (2), A. Osborn (4), L. Johnson (1), M. Lamsi</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/11/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Emailing</i>	<i>Note: E-mail to C. Cooke (2); Receive and review e-mail from C. Cooke (1)</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/12/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Order of Review</i>				
Attorney Time - \$75.00	06/15/2020	0.10	\$75.00	\$7.50	
<i>Activity: Review of:</i>	<i>Note: Receive and review Bi-weekly Update</i>				

Total Paid: 2200.00

Report Total Paid: \$19,388.30